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IRMCD RFP 2024-01 
Request for Proposals 

Legal Services: Labor Relations and Employment Law  
 

 
Sealed proposals must be received by the Indian River Mosquito Control District at the District's office 
located at 5655 41st Street (South Gifford Road), before TIME on DATE. Proposals will be opened 
publicly on DATE at TIME.  Recommendations for the award will be announced at the District’s Board 
of Commissioners meeting held on Tuesday, DATE at TIME.  
 
Detailed specifications for proposals, and all necessary information and instructions for submitting 
proposals may be obtained in person from District office, Monday through Friday, between the hours of 
7:30 AM and 3:30 PM or by phone or e-mail request to: 
 

Indian River Mosquito Control District 
5655 41st Street 

Vero Beach, FL 32967 
Phone: 772-562-2393 

e-mail: irmcd@irmcd.org 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
INDIAN RIVER MOSQUITO CONTROL DISTRICT 
ISSUED at Vero Beach, Florida this ____  day of DATE 
BY: Sherry Burroughs, Executive Director  

http://irmosquito.com/
mailto:irmcd@irmosquito2.org
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CONDITIONS APPLICABLE TO PROPOSALS FOR LEGAL SERVICES   
  
 
Introduction  
The Indian River Mosquito Control District (District) is accepting proposals for legal services relating to 
labor relations and employment law. The selected attorney or firm will be expected to complete a 
comprehensive review of the employee handbook and make compliance recommendations relating to 
labor relations and employment law. Pursuant to section 287.057(3)(e)(4), Florida Statutes, contracts for 
legal services are not subject to competitive solicitation requirements.  
 
Scope of Services 

• Review the employee handbook in its entirety and provide recommendations to improve policy 
clarity and ensure legal compliance. It is expected that policies may be simplified, de-conflicted, 
updated and rendered best practice.  

• Identify which policies are required by Federal and State Law. 
• Provide specific recommendations to simplify the policies and ensure they are consistent and 

flexible while protecting the District from liability.  
• Submit a written report describing the personnel policy review process methodology findings, 

and recommendations for the governing board review. 
• Submit a draft revision of the current Employee Handbook to ensure legal compliance with 

current regulation, legislation, and best practices. 
• Submit a final Employee Handbook incorporating revisions resulting from the review. 

 
Schedule/Timeframe 
The Proposer will have sixty days to review the employee handbook. The first draft will be due by ---------
-. The Governing Board will review the report and handbook draft revisions by --------------. After 
Governing Board approval, Staff will submit comments to the Proposer by ------------------. A final 
handbook will be due by ---------.  
 
Legal Experience 
The Proposer must be in good standing with the Florida Bar. Experience, related to the areas outlined in 
the introduction and scope of services above, should be described. In addition, the proposer should 
describe its organization in terms of the following: 

• Size 
• Structure 
• Area of Practice 
• Office Location 

The Proposer must include the names, addresses, contact persons, and telephone number of at least 
three clients, preferably including clients with similar scope of services.  
 
Attorney Qualifications 
The Proposer should include a description of qualifications of attorneys to be assigned for 
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representation. Descriptions should include: 
• Professional and educational background  
• Exercised supervision 
• Prior experience with requested scope of services.  

 
Only include resumes of attorneys likely to be assigned to the representation. Education, position in 
firm, years, and types of experience as well as continuing professional education will be considered.  

 
Price  
The proposed pricing should include the hourly billing rates of each attorney or other legal staff who are 
expected to work on this representation and charges for any and all expenses.  
 
Evaluation Procedure and Criteria 
The Governing Board will make selection based on the following criteria: 
 

Evaluation Criteria Maximum Rating Points 
Geographic location and accessibility 20 
Past experience with similar assignments   30 
Evidence of respondent’s expertise and 
experience with Labor Relations and Employment 
Law 

20 

Key Personnel 20 
Cost 10 

 
Insurance Coverage 
Proof of insurance coverage shall be provided as part of the submittal and shall include the insurance 
types and required coverage specified below: 

• Workers’ Compensation as required by Florida Statute 
• Professional and general liability with limits of at least $1,000,000 

 
Proposal Package Instructions 

1. Proposals shall be submitted in sealed envelopes and must be received no later than the time 
and date specified on the advertisement enclosed as Page 1. Proposals may be delivered or 
sent to:  

Indian River Mosquito Control District 
5655 41st Street 

Vero Beach, Florida 32967 
Phone:  772-562-2393 

 
2. Envelopes shall be clearly marked as "Proposal to Provide Legal Services" and the Firm name 

shall be clearly marked on the envelope. 

3. (1) Original Proposal and (3) Copies  
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4. The District will make every effort to inform prospective proposers of amendments or 
clarifications of the original specifications. However, the District does not guarantee to provide 
such amendments to all prospective proposers. IT IS THE PROPOSER’S RESPONSIBILITY TO 
REQUEST ANY AMENDMENTS OR CLARIFICATIONS TO THE ORIGINAL SPECIFICATIONS PRIOR TO 
SUBMITTING A PROPOSAL. 

5. No proposal shall be withdrawn for a period of (30) days after the scheduled closing time for 
receipt. The proposal shall be on a firm, net delivered price basis with no escalator clause. The 
District agrees to furnish any tax exemption certificates to which it is entitled. 

6. Proposers must meet all requirements.  

7. Should the service performed differ in any respect from specifications, payment shall be 
withheld until such time as the supplier takes necessary corrective action. 

8. IRS Form W-9 should be included with package 

9. Proof of required insurance coverage should be included with package 

10. Qualifications must be satisfactory to the District's Board of Commissioners, and the District 
reserves the right to reject any and all proposals, to accept at its discretion the lowest and/or 
best proposal, to waive any or all technicalities in awarding, and to re-advertise.  
 

11. Payment and Invoicing – All Invoices shall be submitted to Indian River Mosquito Control 
District.  Failure to submit accurate and complete invoices may cause invoices to be 
rejected.  All invoices shall list a single unique invoice number for processing, it may 
contain letters and/or numbers.  Partial payments may be made upon satisfactory 
delivery of items/services and receipt of invoices.  Invoices are normally paid within 
twenty calendar days of receipt, except in the case where items being billed are called into 
question. IRMCD will notify the contractor within five days of receipt of an invoice for any 
items questioned.  The contractor shall prepare verification data for the amount claimed 
and provide complete cooperation during such investigation.  

 
Note 
12. RESPONSIBLE VENDOR DETERMINATION:  Respondent is hereby notified that Section 

287.05701, Florida Statutes, requires that the District may not request documentation of or 
consider a vendor's social, political, or ideological interests when determining if the vendor is a 
responsible vendor. 

 
13. Public Records - Florida law provides that the District records shall, at all times, be open for 

personal inspection by any person. Information and materials received by the District in 
connection with an RFP response shall be deemed to be public records subject to public 
inspection upon award, recommendation for award, or 10 days after proposals opening, 
whichever occurs first. However, certain exceptions to the public records law are statutorily 
provided in Section 119.07, Florida Statutes. If the Proposer believes any of the information 
contained in its response is exempt from disclosure, then the Proposer must in its response 
specifically identify the material which is deemed to be exempt and cite the legal authority for 
the exemption. Otherwise, the District will treat all materials received as public records.  



JANICE BRODA, COMMISSIONER 
MATT ERPENBECK, COMMISSIONER 
ANNA KIRKLAND, COMMISSIONER 
SHERRY BURROUGHS, EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR  

MEMORANDUM 

  

Date: January 9, 2024 

To: Board of Commissioners 

From: Sherry Burroughs, Executive Director & Lisa Ridley, Finance Director    

Subject: Calendar Year 2024 Adulticide Chemical Bid   

The attached bid comparison document has been prepared by the fiscal section, with staff 
recommendations for product award as follows: 

ADULTICIDE  

 Malathion 96.5% Fyfanon ULV  (Howard Fertilizer) 
 Deltamethrin 2% DeltaGard (Target) 

 



Item UOM Description Product Name Unit Price Container Size Total Price AWARD Vendor 

1 Gallons Malathion 96.5% Fyfanon ULV

$76.15         
$77.60         
$81.10

260 Gallon Tote          
55 Gallon Drum          
2.5 Gallon Jug   

$19,799/Tote     
$4,268/Drum     

$202.75/Gallon Veseris

1 Malathion 96.5% Fyfanon ULV

$79.98         
$73.69         
$92.12

260 Gallon Tote          
55 Gallon Drum          
2.5 Gallon Jug   

$20,794.88/Tote     
$4,052.95/Drum     
$230.30/Gallon Adapco

1 Malathion 96.5% Fyfanon ULV
$59.54           
$59.54

260 Gallon Tote          
2.5 Gallon Jug   

$15,480.40/Tote      
$148.85/Gallon

$15,480.40/Tote         
$148.85/Gallon

Howard 
Fertilizer

1 Malathion 96.5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Target
2 Deltamethrin 2% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Veseris
2 Deltamethrin 2% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Adapco

2 Pounds Deltamethrin 2% DeltaDust Invalid Bid Invalid Bid Invalid Bid
Howard 
Fertilizer

2 Gallons Deltamethrin 2% DeltaGard

$240.00         
$242.00         
$249.00

250 Gallon Tote          
30 Gallon Drum          

(2)2.5 Gallon Case    

$60,000.00/Tote     
$7,290.00/Drum     
$1,245.00/Gallon

$60,000.00/Tote     
$7,290.00/Drum     
$1,245.00/Gallon Target



Enter the name of the Project Lead in cell B3. Enter the Project Start date in cell E3
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Ce UPDATED: 8-Jan-24
Th
is TASK DESCRIPTION

ASSIGNED
TO

PROGRESS START END

Ce
ll Goal 1  Achieve Sustainable Funding Sources

Ce
ll Objective 1a Post draft line-item budget on website Director of Finance & Admin 100% 6/1/23 7/15/23

Objective 1b Post final adopted budget on website Director of Finance & Admin 100% 9/1/23 9/30/23

R
o Objective 2 Develop reserve fund balance policy Director of Finance & Admin 100% 4/1/23 9/30/23

Objective 3 Develop a 5-year CIP & present to Board Director of Finance & Admin 40% 4/1/23 3/30/24

Objective 4 Create review process for alternative funding sources Director of Finance & Admin 100% 6/1/23 12/30/23

Th
e Goal 2  Outreach & Community Engagement

Objective 1a Schedule two outreach events Human Resources Generalist 100% 3/1/23 9/30/23

Objective 1b Schedule three outreach events Director of Scientific Programs 10/1/23 9/30/24

Objective 2
Develop job description for public relations position 
& cost, present with budget

Human Resources Generalist 100% 3/1/23 4/30/23

Objective 3 Develop Communications Plan Public Relations Position 12/30/23 12/30/24

Objective 4a
Assess effectivenss of outreach events on a quarterly 
basis

Human Resources Generalist 50% 10/1/23 12/31/23

Objective 4b
Assess effectivenss of outreach events on a quarterly 
basis

Public Relations Position 1/1/24 3/31/24

Objective 4c
Assess effectivenss of outreach events on a quarterly 
basis

Public Relations Position 4/1/24 6/30/24

Objective 4d
Assess effectivenss of outreach events on a quarterly 
basis

Public Relations Position 7/1/24 9/30/24

Sam Goal 3 Effective Mosquito Control Using Innovation and Scientific Techniques

Project Start:

Display Week:

Wed, 3/1/2023
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Ce UPDATED: 8-Jan-24
Th
is TASK DESCRIPTION

ASSIGNED
TO

PROGRESS START END

Display Week:

Objective 1
Respond to service requests within two business 
days

Director of Scientific Programs 10% 10/1/23 9/30/24

Objective 2 Assess efficacy & efficiency of treatments
Director of Scientific Programs & 

Director of Operations
30% 10/1/23 9/30/24

Objective 3a
Testing & evaluation of products on semi-annual 
basis

Director of Scientific Programs & 
Director of Operations

100% 4/1/23 9/30/23

Objective 3b
Testing & evaluation of products on semi-annual 
basis

Director of Scientific Programs & 
Director of Operations

10% 9/30/23 3/30/24

Objective 4
Develop plan to expand larviciding to western 
portions of District

Director of Operations 60% 3/1/23 6/30/24

Sam Goal 4  Safe & Ecologically Minded Best Management Practices & Techniques

Objective 1
Review product labels and safety data sheets on 
monthly basis and report findings to Executive 
Director

Aerial Coordinator/Specialist 100% 3/1/23 9/30/23

Objective 2a Conduct quarterly safety committee meetings
Operations & 

Safety Committee Chair
100% 3/1/23 3/31/23

Objective 2b Conduct quarterly safety committee meetings
Operations & 

Safety Committee Chair
100% 4/1/23 6/30/23

Objective 2c Conduct quarterly safety committee meetings
Operations & 

Safety Committee Chair
100% 7/1/23 9/30/23

Objective 2d Conduct quarterly safety committee meetings
Operations & 

Safety Committee Chair
100% 10/1/23 12/31/23

Objective 3 Ensure all staff are licensed Human Resources Generalist 100% 3/1/23 9/30/23

Objective 4 Conduct annual calibration of equipment Director of Operations 1/1/24 3/30/24

Objective 5 Annually report chemical usage to USFWS NWRs Director of Operations 100% 11/1/23 12/30/23

Sam Goal 5  Invest in Professional Development of Employees

Objective 1
Conduct compensation and benefits study and 
submit to Board for approval

Human Resources Generalist 100% 2/1/23 6/30/23

Page 2 of 3
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Ce UPDATED: 8-Jan-24
Th
is TASK DESCRIPTION

ASSIGNED
TO

PROGRESS START END

Display Week:

Objective 2a
Conduct quarterly market analysis of compensation 
and report findings to the Executive Director

Human Resources Generalist 100% 7/1/23 9/30/23

Objective 2b
Conduct quarterly market analysis of compensation 
and report findings to the Executive Director

Human Resources Generalist 100% 10/1/23 12/31/23

Objective 2c
Conduct quarterly market analysis of compensation 
and report findings to the Executive Director

Human Resources Generalist 1/1/24 3/31/24

Objective 2d
Conduct quarterly market analysis of compensation 
and report findings to the Executive Director

Human Resources Generalist 4/1/24 6/30/24

Objective 3
Spill response team to attend annual training to 
maintain certification 

Human Resources Generalist 100% 3/1/23 9/30/23

Objective 4
Professional staff to continue involvement in 
professional associations & provide presentations at 

Director of Scientific Programs 100% 3/1/23 9/30/23

Objective 5
Recommend training opportunites for staff's career 
development for budget considerations

Directors 100% 3/1/23 4/30/23

Objective 6
Review positions and advise of list of eligible retirees 
& critical positions for succession planning

Human Resources Generalist 100% 4/1/23 6/30/23

Sam Goal 6 Embracing Environmental Challenges using Sound Science & Strong Partnerships

Objective 1
One member of the Permanent Control staff will be 
trained and licensed in Natural Areas

Director of Operations 100% 10/1/23 9/30/24

Objective 2
Collaborate with IRLT in evaluating drawdowns and 
effects of juvenile fish populations

Director of Operations 100% 3/1/23 6/30/23

Objective 3a
Establish contract for water quality monitoring of 
impoundments

Director of Finance & Admin 100% 3/1/23 9/30/23

Objective 3b
Develop & implement a water quality monitoring 
plan for impoundments

Director of Scientific Programs 100% 10/1/23 12/31/23

Objective 4
Establish a list of current & potential 
environmental/ecological partners to develop 
working relationships with the District

Executive Director 100% 3/1/23 12/31/23

Page 3 of 3
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